
Item UNIT
ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

Part A - General (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

A1 Mobilization/Bonds/Insurance LS 1 148,200.00$              $163,100.00 $163,100.00

A2 Traffic Control, Residential Streets Day 280 600.00$                      $524.25 $146,790.00

A3 Traffic Control, Arterial Streets Day 90 700.00$                      $640.75 $57,667.50

A4 Mobilization for 24-HR Notice (See General EA 50 800.00$                      $1,165.00 $58,250.00

A5 Traffic Control 24-HR Notice (See General EA 50 800.00$                      $3,145.50 $157,275.00

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (A1 thru A5) $583,082.50

Part B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

B1 Seal Coat, per single course SY 1,600 6.00$                           $3.47 $5,552.00

B2 Crack Seal, 0-1" wide LF 1,000 6.00$                           $1.63 $1,630.00

B3

Planing (Milling), 2"                                                                       

1,000 to 2,000 SY minimum per Delivery 

Order

SY 1,600 6.00$                           
$6.62 $10,592.00

B4

Planing (Milling), Additional 1"                                                   

1000 to 2,000 SY minimum per Delivery 

Order

SY 1,600  $                           3.00 
$5.83 $9,328.00

B5 Ozone Days EA 5 700.00$                      $590.00 $2,950.00

B6

Cement Stabilized Base with 4% Cement, 

existing limestone base, 3-6", complete in 

place per SY

SY 700 4.00$                           
$10.58 $7,406.00

B6A
Unanticipated Street Improvement 

Continengency
LS 1 $20,000 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

B7 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 20.00$                         $28.41 $2,841.00

B8 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 2,200 12.00$                         $10.48 $23,056.00

B9 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 10,000 7.00$                           $6.80 $68,000.00

B9A Base Repair - Utility Cuts - (See General SY/FT 2,750 56.00$                         $30.70 $84,425.00

B10 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 14,750 24.00$                         $18.24 $269,040.00

B11 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 12,000 12.00$                         $10.22 $122,640.00

B12 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 21.00$                         $29.56 $2,956.00

B13 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 2,400 12.50$                         $11.96 $28,704.00

B14 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 7,000 7.00$                           $7.75 $54,250.00

B15 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 6,000 24.00$                         $19.71 $118,260.00

B16 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 6,000 12.00$                         $11.25 $67,500.00

B17 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 20.00$                         $29.56 $2,956.00

B18 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 6,000 12.00$                         $12.06 $72,360.00

B19 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 6,000 6.00$                           $7.48 $44,880.00

B20 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 6,000 22.00$                         $19.71 $118,260.00

B21 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 6,000 11.00$                         $11.25 $67,500.00

SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (B1 thru B21) $1,205,086.00

Part C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT) - NA

C1 NA $0.00

SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (Item C1) $0.00

Part D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

D1 SF 300 24.00$                         
$17.50 $5,250.00

D2 SF 300 30.00$                         
$20.65 $6,195.00

SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (D1 THRU D2) $11,445.00

Range 1 to 100 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 1/2-Mile Square Area.

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements    Project E-14034 1

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING - BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                  

Bid Tabulation By:  Felix H. Ocanas, Jr., P.E.                                                                                                                                                                                                

Bid Date:  March 11, 2015                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Time of Completion:  365 Calendar Days

Base Bid

DESCRIPTION

Grace Paving And  Construction, Inc.   4237 

Baldwin Blvd.   Corpus Christi, Texas   78405-

3324

Range 250 to 1000 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 3-Mile Square Area.

New ADA Curb Ramp: Concrete Curb Ramps, meeting TDLR 

requirements, complete in place

Remove and Replace ADA curb ramp: Removal and 

Replacement of ADA ramps not in compliance with TDLR

Range 100 to 250 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 1-Mile Square Area.
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Item UNIT
ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements    Project E-14034 1

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING - BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                  

Bid Tabulation By:  Felix H. Ocanas, Jr., P.E.                                                                                                                                                                                                

Bid Date:  March 11, 2015                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Time of Completion:  365 Calendar Days

DESCRIPTION

Grace Paving And  Construction, Inc.   4237 

Baldwin Blvd.   Corpus Christi, Texas   78405-

3324

Part E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

E1 LF 3,000 25.00$                         
$16.79 $50,370.00

E2 SF 1,000 12.00$                         
$6.88 $6,880.00

E3 Each 10 1,600.00$                   

$855.50 $8,555.00

SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (E1 THRU E3) $65,805.00

Part F - WATER IMROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

F1 Each 10
800.00$                      $643.10 $6,431.00

SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (F1) $6,431.00

Part G -WASTEWATER IMROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

G1 Each 10 2,000.00$                   

$855.50 $8,555.00

SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (G1) $8,555.00

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (Items A1 thru A5) $583,082.50

SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (Items B1 thru B21) $1,205,086.00

SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS  -  NA $0.00

SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (Items D1 thru D2) $11,445.00

SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (Items E1 thru E3) $65,805.00

SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items F1) $6,431.00

SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items G1) $8,555.00

TOTAL PROJECT BASE BID (PARTS A THRU G) __1 / $1,880,404.50

NOTES:

__1 /  Grace Paving & Construction, Inc. listed dollar amount for Part C-RTA Improvements

            in the Bid Summary.  This Section has zero Project Items.

           Grace Paving & Construction, Inc. also miscalculated Part D-ADA Improvements 

           The correct figure should be $11,445.00.

__2 /   LNV, Inc.  listed dollar amount for Part C-RTA Improvements in the Bid Summary.  This 

           section has zero Project Items. 

__ 3 /   No discrepancies found in these Bids.

__ 4 /   Gourley Contracting had an Incomplete Bid and No Bid Security.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Sanitary Sewer Manhole Ring & Cover Adjustment, including 

New Manhole Ring & Cover Assembly with new HDPE Height 

Adjustment Rings, Stainless Steel Inflow Inhibitor and with 

Concrete Collar, complete in place.

Removal and Replacement of driveway approaches, complete 

and in place.

Storm Water Manhole Ring & Cover Adjustment, with new 

Manhole Ring and Cover Assembly with New Concrete Height 

Adjustment Rings and with Concrete Collar, complete in place.

Water Valve Adjustment with Concrete Collar, complete in 

place

Removal and Replacement of Curb & Gutter, complete in place

BID TABULATION
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Item UNIT
ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE

Part A - General (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

A1 Mobilization/Bonds/Insurance LS 1 148,200.00$              

A2 Traffic Control, Residential Streets Day 280 600.00$                      

A3 Traffic Control, Arterial Streets Day 90 700.00$                      

A4 Mobilization for 24-HR Notice (See General EA 50 800.00$                      

A5 Traffic Control 24-HR Notice (See General EA 50 800.00$                      

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (A1 thru A5)

Part B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

B1 Seal Coat, per single course SY 1,600 6.00$                           

B2 Crack Seal, 0-1" wide LF 1,000 6.00$                           

B3

Planing (Milling), 2"                                                                       

1,000 to 2,000 SY minimum per Delivery 

Order

SY 1,600 6.00$                           

B4

Planing (Milling), Additional 1"                                                   

1000 to 2,000 SY minimum per Delivery 

Order

SY 1,600  $                           3.00 

B5 Ozone Days EA 5 700.00$                      

B6

Cement Stabilized Base with 4% Cement, 

existing limestone base, 3-6", complete in 

place per SY

SY 700 4.00$                           

B6A
Unanticipated Street Improvement 

Continengency
LS 1 $20,000

B7 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 20.00$                         

B8 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 2,200 12.00$                         

B9 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 10,000 7.00$                           

B9A Base Repair - Utility Cuts - (See General SY/FT 2,750 56.00$                         

B10 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 14,750 24.00$                         

B11 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 12,000 12.00$                         

B12 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 21.00$                         

B13 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 2,400 12.50$                         

B14 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 7,000 7.00$                           

B15 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 6,000 24.00$                         

B16 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 6,000 12.00$                         

B17 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 20.00$                         

B18 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 6,000 12.00$                         

B19 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 6,000 6.00$                           

B20 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 6,000 22.00$                         

B21 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 6,000 11.00$                         
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (B1 thru B21) 

Part C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT) - NA

C1 NA

SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (Item C1)

Part D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

D1 SF 300 24.00$                         

D2 SF 300 30.00$                         

SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (D1 THRU D2)

Range 1 to 100 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 1/2-Mile Square Area.

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements    Project E-14034

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING - BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                  

Bid Tabulation By:  Felix H. Ocanas, Jr., P.E.                                                                                                                                                                                                

Bid Date:  March 11, 2015                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Time of Completion:  365 Calendar Days

Base Bid

DESCRIPTION

Range 250 to 1000 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 3-Mile Square Area.

New ADA Curb Ramp: Concrete Curb Ramps, meeting TDLR 

requirements, complete in place

Remove and Replace ADA curb ramp: Removal and 

Replacement of ADA ramps not in compliance with TDLR

Range 100 to 250 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 1-Mile Square Area.

UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

$102,495.00 $102,495.00

$150.00 $42,000.00

$200.00 $18,000.00

$1,500.00 $75,000.00

$750.00 $37,500.00

$274,995.00

$4.50 $7,200.00

$3.00 $3,000.00

$14.00 $22,400.00

$7.00 $11,200.00

$975.00 $4,875.00

$20.00 $14,000.00

$20,000.00 $20,000.00

$30.00 $3,000.00

$21.75 $47,850.00

$9.00 $90,000.00

$62.00 $170,500.00

$25.25 $372,437.50
$14.00 $168,000.00

$30.00 $3,000.00

$21.75 $52,200.00

$9.00 $63,000.00

$26.50 $159,000.00
$14.00 $84,000.00

$30.00 $3,000.00

$21.75 $130,500.00

$9.00 $54,000.00

$27.00 $162,000.00
$14.75 $88,500.00

$1,733,662.50

$0.00

$0.00

$35.00 $10,500.00

$45.00 $13,500.00

$24,000.00

2

A. Ortiz Construction & Paving Inc.  102 

Airport Rd.   Corpus Christi, Texas   78405
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Item UNIT
ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements    Project E-14034

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING - BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                  

Bid Tabulation By:  Felix H. Ocanas, Jr., P.E.                                                                                                                                                                                                

Bid Date:  March 11, 2015                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Time of Completion:  365 Calendar Days

DESCRIPTION

Part E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

E1 LF 3,000 25.00$                         

E2 SF 1,000 12.00$                         

E3 Each 10 1,600.00$                   

SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (E1 THRU E3)

Part F - WATER IMROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

F1 Each 10
800.00$                      

SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (F1)

Part G -WASTEWATER IMROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

G1 Each 10 2,000.00$                   

SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (G1)

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (Items A1 thru A5)

SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (Items B1 thru B21)

SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS  -  NA

SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (Items D1 thru D2)

SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (Items E1 thru E3)

SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items F1)

SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items G1)

TOTAL PROJECT BASE BID (PARTS A THRU G)

NOTES:

__1 /  Grace Paving & Construction, Inc. listed dollar amount for Part C-RTA Improvements

            in the Bid Summary.  This Section has zero Project Items.

           Grace Paving & Construction, Inc. also miscalculated Part D-ADA Improvements 

           The correct figure should be $11,445.00.

__2 /   LNV, Inc.  listed dollar amount for Part C-RTA Improvements in the Bid Summary.  This 

           section has zero Project Items. 

__ 3 /   No discrepancies found in these Bids.

__ 4 /   Gourley Contracting had an Incomplete Bid and No Bid Security.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Sanitary Sewer Manhole Ring & Cover Adjustment, including 

New Manhole Ring & Cover Assembly with new HDPE Height 

Adjustment Rings, Stainless Steel Inflow Inhibitor and with 

Concrete Collar, complete in place.

Removal and Replacement of driveway approaches, complete 

and in place.

Storm Water Manhole Ring & Cover Adjustment, with new 

Manhole Ring and Cover Assembly with New Concrete Height 

Adjustment Rings and with Concrete Collar, complete in place.

Water Valve Adjustment with Concrete Collar, complete in 

place

Removal and Replacement of Curb & Gutter, complete in place

UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

2

A. Ortiz Construction & Paving Inc.  102 

Airport Rd.   Corpus Christi, Texas   78405

$30.00 $90,000.00

$16.00 $16,000.00

$2,500.00 $25,000.00

$131,000.00

$375.00 $3,750.00

$3,750.00

$2,500.00 $25,000.00

$25,000.00

$274,995.00

$1,733,662.50

$0.00

$24,000.00

$131,000.00

$3,750.00

$25,000.00

__3 / $2,192,407.50

BID TABULATION

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements Project #E14034
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Item UNIT
ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE

Part A - General (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

A1 Mobilization/Bonds/Insurance LS 1 148,200.00$              

A2 Traffic Control, Residential Streets Day 280 600.00$                      

A3 Traffic Control, Arterial Streets Day 90 700.00$                      

A4 Mobilization for 24-HR Notice (See General EA 50 800.00$                      

A5 Traffic Control 24-HR Notice (See General EA 50 800.00$                      

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (A1 thru A5)

Part B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

B1 Seal Coat, per single course SY 1,600 6.00$                           

B2 Crack Seal, 0-1" wide LF 1,000 6.00$                           

B3

Planing (Milling), 2"                                                                       

1,000 to 2,000 SY minimum per Delivery 

Order

SY 1,600 6.00$                           

B4

Planing (Milling), Additional 1"                                                   

1000 to 2,000 SY minimum per Delivery 

Order

SY 1,600  $                           3.00 

B5 Ozone Days EA 5 700.00$                      

B6

Cement Stabilized Base with 4% Cement, 

existing limestone base, 3-6", complete in 

place per SY

SY 700 4.00$                           

B6A
Unanticipated Street Improvement 

Continengency
LS 1 $20,000

B7 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 20.00$                         

B8 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 2,200 12.00$                         

B9 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 10,000 7.00$                           

B9A Base Repair - Utility Cuts - (See General SY/FT 2,750 56.00$                         

B10 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 14,750 24.00$                         

B11 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 12,000 12.00$                         

B12 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 21.00$                         

B13 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 2,400 12.50$                         

B14 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 7,000 7.00$                           

B15 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 6,000 24.00$                         

B16 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 6,000 12.00$                         

B17 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 20.00$                         

B18 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 6,000 12.00$                         

B19 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 6,000 6.00$                           

B20 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 6,000 22.00$                         

B21 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 6,000 11.00$                         
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (B1 thru B21) 

Part C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT) - NA

C1 NA

SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (Item C1)

Part D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

D1 SF 300 24.00$                         

D2 SF 300 30.00$                         

SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (D1 THRU D2)

Range 1 to 100 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 1/2-Mile Square Area.

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements    Project E-14034

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING - BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                  

Bid Tabulation By:  Felix H. Ocanas, Jr., P.E.                                                                                                                                                                                                

Bid Date:  March 11, 2015                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Time of Completion:  365 Calendar Days

Base Bid

DESCRIPTION

Range 250 to 1000 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 3-Mile Square Area.

New ADA Curb Ramp: Concrete Curb Ramps, meeting TDLR 

requirements, complete in place

Remove and Replace ADA curb ramp: Removal and 

Replacement of ADA ramps not in compliance with TDLR

Range 100 to 250 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 1-Mile Square Area.

UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

$90,600.00 $90,600.00

$411.09 $115,105.20

$662.40 $59,616.00

$350.40 $17,520.00

$602.40 $30,120.00

$312,961.20

$7.80 $12,480.00

$5.52 $5,520.00

$5.69 $9,104.00

$3.21 $5,136.00

$480.00 $2,400.00

$7.89 $5,523.00

$20,000.00 $20,000.00

$28.56 $2,856.00

$15.71 $34,562.00

$7.23 $72,300.00

$45.21 $124,327.50

$29.78 $439,255.00
$17.25 $207,000.00

$16.92 $1,692.00

$15.71 $37,704.00

$7.24 $50,680.00

$29.77 $178,620.00
$17.25 $103,500.00

$16.92 $1,692.00

$15.72 $94,320.00

$7.23 $43,380.00

$29.77 $178,620.00
$17.25 $103,500.00

$1,734,171.50

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00

$13.12 $3,936.00

$16.40 $4,920.00

$8,856.00

LNV, Inc. 801 Navigation Blvd.,   Suite 300     

Corpus Christi, Texas  78408

3
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Item UNIT
ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements    Project E-14034

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING - BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                  

Bid Tabulation By:  Felix H. Ocanas, Jr., P.E.                                                                                                                                                                                                

Bid Date:  March 11, 2015                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Time of Completion:  365 Calendar Days

DESCRIPTION

Part E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

E1 LF 3,000 25.00$                         

E2 SF 1,000 12.00$                         

E3 Each 10 1,600.00$                   

SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (E1 THRU E3)

Part F - WATER IMROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

F1 Each 10
800.00$                      

SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (F1)

Part G -WASTEWATER IMROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

G1 Each 10 2,000.00$                   

SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (G1)

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (Items A1 thru A5)

SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (Items B1 thru B21)

SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS  -  NA

SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (Items D1 thru D2)

SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (Items E1 thru E3)

SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items F1)

SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items G1)

TOTAL PROJECT BASE BID (PARTS A THRU G)

NOTES:

__1 /  Grace Paving & Construction, Inc. listed dollar amount for Part C-RTA Improvements

            in the Bid Summary.  This Section has zero Project Items.

           Grace Paving & Construction, Inc. also miscalculated Part D-ADA Improvements 

           The correct figure should be $11,445.00.

__2 /   LNV, Inc.  listed dollar amount for Part C-RTA Improvements in the Bid Summary.  This 

           section has zero Project Items. 

__ 3 /   No discrepancies found in these Bids.

__ 4 /   Gourley Contracting had an Incomplete Bid and No Bid Security.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Sanitary Sewer Manhole Ring & Cover Adjustment, including 

New Manhole Ring & Cover Assembly with new HDPE Height 

Adjustment Rings, Stainless Steel Inflow Inhibitor and with 

Concrete Collar, complete in place.

Removal and Replacement of driveway approaches, complete 

and in place.

Storm Water Manhole Ring & Cover Adjustment, with new 

Manhole Ring and Cover Assembly with New Concrete Height 

Adjustment Rings and with Concrete Collar, complete in place.

Water Valve Adjustment with Concrete Collar, complete in 

place

Removal and Replacement of Curb & Gutter, complete in place

UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

LNV, Inc. 801 Navigation Blvd.,   Suite 300     

Corpus Christi, Texas  78408

3

$26.88 $80,640.00

$10.80 $10,800.00

$1,956.00 $19,560.00

$111,000.00

$432.00 $4,320.00

$4,320.00

$1,800.00 $18,000.00

$18,000.00

$312,961.20

$1,734,171.50

$0.00

$8,856.00

$111,000.00

$4,320.00

$18,000.00

__2 / $2,189,308.70

BID TABULATION

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements Project #E14034
Page 6 of 10

REV 10-14-2014



Item UNIT
ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE

Part A - General (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

A1 Mobilization/Bonds/Insurance LS 1 148,200.00$              

A2 Traffic Control, Residential Streets Day 280 600.00$                      

A3 Traffic Control, Arterial Streets Day 90 700.00$                      

A4 Mobilization for 24-HR Notice (See General EA 50 800.00$                      

A5 Traffic Control 24-HR Notice (See General EA 50 800.00$                      

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (A1 thru A5)

Part B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

B1 Seal Coat, per single course SY 1,600 6.00$                           

B2 Crack Seal, 0-1" wide LF 1,000 6.00$                           

B3

Planing (Milling), 2"                                                                       

1,000 to 2,000 SY minimum per Delivery 

Order

SY 1,600 6.00$                           

B4

Planing (Milling), Additional 1"                                                   

1000 to 2,000 SY minimum per Delivery 

Order

SY 1,600  $                           3.00 

B5 Ozone Days EA 5 700.00$                      

B6

Cement Stabilized Base with 4% Cement, 

existing limestone base, 3-6", complete in 

place per SY

SY 700 4.00$                           

B6A
Unanticipated Street Improvement 

Continengency
LS 1 $20,000

B7 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 20.00$                         

B8 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 2,200 12.00$                         

B9 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 10,000 7.00$                           

B9A Base Repair - Utility Cuts - (See General SY/FT 2,750 56.00$                         

B10 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 14,750 24.00$                         

B11 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 12,000 12.00$                         

B12 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 21.00$                         

B13 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 2,400 12.50$                         

B14 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 7,000 7.00$                           

B15 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 6,000 24.00$                         

B16 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 6,000 12.00$                         

B17 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 20.00$                         

B18 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 6,000 12.00$                         

B19 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 6,000 6.00$                           

B20 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 6,000 22.00$                         

B21 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 6,000 11.00$                         
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (B1 thru B21) 

Part C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT) - NA

C1 NA

SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (Item C1)

Part D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

D1 SF 300 24.00$                         

D2 SF 300 30.00$                         

SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (D1 THRU D2)

Range 1 to 100 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 1/2-Mile Square Area.

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements    Project E-14034

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING - BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                  

Bid Tabulation By:  Felix H. Ocanas, Jr., P.E.                                                                                                                                                                                                

Bid Date:  March 11, 2015                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Time of Completion:  365 Calendar Days

Base Bid

DESCRIPTION

Range 250 to 1000 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 3-Mile Square Area.

New ADA Curb Ramp: Concrete Curb Ramps, meeting TDLR 

requirements, complete in place

Remove and Replace ADA curb ramp: Removal and 

Replacement of ADA ramps not in compliance with TDLR

Range 100 to 250 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 1-Mile Square Area.

UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

$392,500.00 $392,500.00

$368.66 $103,224.80

$736.14 $66,252.60

$3,836.42 $191,821.00

$964.09 $48,204.50

$802,002.90

$8.26 $13,216.00

$4.85 $4,850.00

$5.81 $9,296.00

$5.81 $9,296.00

$1,660.50 $8,302.50

$17.86 $12,502.00

$20,000.00 $20,000.00

$111.02 $11,102.00

$9.41 $20,702.00

$3.67 $36,700.00

$57.96 $159,390.00

$19.23 $283,642.50
$13.01 $156,120.00

$111.02 $11,102.00

$8.96 $21,504.00

$4.56 $31,920.00

$22.08 $132,480.00
$13.99 $83,940.00

$111.02 $11,102.00

$6.65 $39,900.00

$5.05 $30,300.00

$19.90 $119,400.00
$12.54 $75,240.00

$1,302,007.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00

$73.69 $22,107.00

$117.41 $35,223.00

$57,330.00

Salinas Construction Technologies, LTD.   

3734 FM 3006    Pleasanton, Texas    78064

4

BID TABULATION

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements Project #E14034
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REV 10-14-2014



Item UNIT
ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements    Project E-14034

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING - BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                  

Bid Tabulation By:  Felix H. Ocanas, Jr., P.E.                                                                                                                                                                                                

Bid Date:  March 11, 2015                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Time of Completion:  365 Calendar Days

DESCRIPTION

Part E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

E1 LF 3,000 25.00$                         

E2 SF 1,000 12.00$                         

E3 Each 10 1,600.00$                   

SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (E1 THRU E3)

Part F - WATER IMROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

F1 Each 10
800.00$                      

SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (F1)

Part G -WASTEWATER IMROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

G1 Each 10 2,000.00$                   

SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (G1)

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (Items A1 thru A5)

SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (Items B1 thru B21)

SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS  -  NA

SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (Items D1 thru D2)

SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (Items E1 thru E3)

SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items F1)

SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items G1)

TOTAL PROJECT BASE BID (PARTS A THRU G)

NOTES:

__1 /  Grace Paving & Construction, Inc. listed dollar amount for Part C-RTA Improvements

            in the Bid Summary.  This Section has zero Project Items.

           Grace Paving & Construction, Inc. also miscalculated Part D-ADA Improvements 

           The correct figure should be $11,445.00.

__2 /   LNV, Inc.  listed dollar amount for Part C-RTA Improvements in the Bid Summary.  This 

           section has zero Project Items. 

__ 3 /   No discrepancies found in these Bids.

__ 4 /   Gourley Contracting had an Incomplete Bid and No Bid Security.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Sanitary Sewer Manhole Ring & Cover Adjustment, including 

New Manhole Ring & Cover Assembly with new HDPE Height 

Adjustment Rings, Stainless Steel Inflow Inhibitor and with 

Concrete Collar, complete in place.

Removal and Replacement of driveway approaches, complete 

and in place.

Storm Water Manhole Ring & Cover Adjustment, with new 

Manhole Ring and Cover Assembly with New Concrete Height 

Adjustment Rings and with Concrete Collar, complete in place.

Water Valve Adjustment with Concrete Collar, complete in 

place

Removal and Replacement of Curb & Gutter, complete in place

UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

Salinas Construction Technologies, LTD.   

3734 FM 3006    Pleasanton, Texas    78064

4

$48.32 $144,960.00

$29.52 $29,520.00

$2,400.00 $24,000.00

$198,480.00

$1,003.94 $10,039.40

$10,039.40

$2,713.45 $27,134.50

$27,134.50

$802,002.90

$1,302,007.00

$0.00

$57,330.00

$198,480.00

$10,039.40

$27,134.50

__3 / $2,396,993.80

BID TABULATION

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements Project #E14034
Page 8 of 10

REV 10-14-2014



Item UNIT
ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE

Part A - General (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

A1 Mobilization/Bonds/Insurance LS 1 148,200.00$              

A2 Traffic Control, Residential Streets Day 280 600.00$                      

A3 Traffic Control, Arterial Streets Day 90 700.00$                      

A4 Mobilization for 24-HR Notice (See General EA 50 800.00$                      

A5 Traffic Control 24-HR Notice (See General EA 50 800.00$                      

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (A1 thru A5)

Part B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

B1 Seal Coat, per single course SY 1,600 6.00$                           

B2 Crack Seal, 0-1" wide LF 1,000 6.00$                           

B3

Planing (Milling), 2"                                                                       

1,000 to 2,000 SY minimum per Delivery 

Order

SY 1,600 6.00$                           

B4

Planing (Milling), Additional 1"                                                   

1000 to 2,000 SY minimum per Delivery 

Order

SY 1,600  $                           3.00 

B5 Ozone Days EA 5 700.00$                      

B6

Cement Stabilized Base with 4% Cement, 

existing limestone base, 3-6", complete in 

place per SY

SY 700 4.00$                           

B6A
Unanticipated Street Improvement 

Continengency
LS 1 $20,000

B7 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 20.00$                         

B8 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 2,200 12.00$                         

B9 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 10,000 7.00$                           

B9A Base Repair - Utility Cuts - (See General SY/FT 2,750 56.00$                         

B10 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 14,750 24.00$                         

B11 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 12,000 12.00$                         

B12 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 21.00$                         

B13 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 2,400 12.50$                         

B14 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 7,000 7.00$                           

B15 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 6,000 24.00$                         

B16 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 6,000 12.00$                         

B17 Subgrade Repair up to 4-6" Depth (lime SY 100 20.00$                         

B18 Base Repair, Upper 2" Depth  (Limestone) SY 6,000 12.00$                         

B19 Base Repair, Additional 1" Depth SY 6,000 6.00$                           

B20 Surface Treatment Repair Upper 2" HMAC SY 6,000 22.00$                         

B21 Surface Treatment Repair Additional 1" SY 6,000 11.00$                         
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (B1 thru B21) 

Part C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT) - NA

C1 NA

SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (Item C1)

Part D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

D1 SF 300 24.00$                         

D2 SF 300 30.00$                         

SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (D1 THRU D2)

Range 1 to 100 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 1/2-Mile Square Area.

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements    Project E-14034

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING - BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                  

Bid Tabulation By:  Felix H. Ocanas, Jr., P.E.                                                                                                                                                                                                

Bid Date:  March 11, 2015                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Time of Completion:  365 Calendar Days

Base Bid

DESCRIPTION

Range 250 to 1000 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 3-Mile Square Area.

New ADA Curb Ramp: Concrete Curb Ramps, meeting TDLR 

requirements, complete in place

Remove and Replace ADA curb ramp: Removal and 

Replacement of ADA ramps not in compliance with TDLR

Range 100 to 250 SY - Localized Flexible Pavement Structure Repairs with saw cutting existing roadway; subgrade, base and surface 

treatment/repair using asphalt concrete (hot/cold mix).  All work will be within 1-Mile Square Area.

UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

$90,000.00 $90,000.00

$300.00 $84,000.00

$300.00 $27,000.00

$600.00 $30,000.00

$600.00 $30,000.00

$261,000.00

$8.55 $13,680.00

$3.00 $3,000.00

$9.00 $14,400.00

$9.00 $14,400.00

$1,800.00 $9,000.00

$9.00 $6,300.00

$20,000.00 $20,000.00

$18.00 $1,800.00

$15.75 $34,650.00

$18.00 $180,000.00

$12.00 $33,000.00

$18.00 $265,500.00
$15.75 $189,000.00

$9.00 $900.00

$18.00 $43,200.00

$15.00 $105,000.00

$18.00 $108,000.00
$15.75 $94,500.00

$9.00 $900.00

$18.00 $108,000.00

$15.00 $90,000.00

$18.00 $108,000.00
$15.75 $94,500.00

$1,537,730.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00

$24.00 $7,200.00

$24.00 $7,200.00

$14,400.00

Gourley Contracting    4921 Ambassador 

Row   Corpus Christi, Texas   78416
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ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements Project #E14034
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Item UNIT
ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY
UNIT PRICE

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements    Project E-14034

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING - BID TABULATION                                                                                                                                                  

Bid Tabulation By:  Felix H. Ocanas, Jr., P.E.                                                                                                                                                                                                

Bid Date:  March 11, 2015                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Time of Completion:  365 Calendar Days

DESCRIPTION

Part E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

E1 LF 3,000 25.00$                         

E2 SF 1,000 12.00$                         

E3 Each 10 1,600.00$                   

SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (E1 THRU E3)

Part F - WATER IMROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

F1 Each 10
800.00$                      

SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (F1)

Part G -WASTEWATER IMROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

G1 Each 10 2,000.00$                   

SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (G1)

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (Items A1 thru A5)

SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (Items B1 thru B21)

SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS  -  NA

SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (Items D1 thru D2)

SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (Items E1 thru E3)

SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items F1)

SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items G1)

TOTAL PROJECT BASE BID (PARTS A THRU G)

NOTES:

__1 /  Grace Paving & Construction, Inc. listed dollar amount for Part C-RTA Improvements

            in the Bid Summary.  This Section has zero Project Items.

           Grace Paving & Construction, Inc. also miscalculated Part D-ADA Improvements 

           The correct figure should be $11,445.00.

__2 /   LNV, Inc.  listed dollar amount for Part C-RTA Improvements in the Bid Summary.  This 

           section has zero Project Items. 

__ 3 /   No discrepancies found in these Bids.

__ 4 /   Gourley Contracting had an Incomplete Bid and No Bid Security.

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Sanitary Sewer Manhole Ring & Cover Adjustment, including 

New Manhole Ring & Cover Assembly with new HDPE Height 

Adjustment Rings, Stainless Steel Inflow Inhibitor and with 

Concrete Collar, complete in place.

Removal and Replacement of driveway approaches, complete 

and in place.

Storm Water Manhole Ring & Cover Adjustment, with new 

Manhole Ring and Cover Assembly with New Concrete Height 

Adjustment Rings and with Concrete Collar, complete in place.

Water Valve Adjustment with Concrete Collar, complete in 

place

Removal and Replacement of Curb & Gutter, complete in place

UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

Gourley Contracting    4921 Ambassador 

Row   Corpus Christi, Texas   78416

5

$22.00 $66,000.00

$9.00 $9,000.00

$4,500.00 $45,000.00

$120,000.00

$250.00 $2,500.00

$2,500.00

$4,500.00 $45,000.00

$45,000.00

$261,000.00

$1,537,730.00

$0.00

$14,400.00

$120,000.00

$2,500.00

$45,000.00

__4 / $1,980,630.00

BID TABULATION

ID/IQ Minor Street Pavement Improvements Project #E14034
Page 10 of 10

REV 10-14-2014


